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ABSTRACT 

 

The objective of this thesis is to study protection of the child and the woman in the 
proceeding of examining persons by scientific method prescribed by Section 131/1 of the 
Criminal Procedure Code. The concept of and the rule on collection of evidences to be examined 
by scientific method from a personhs body which are provided by Thai law will be studied and 
compared to those provided by foreign law in order to find an appropriate guideline for protecting 
the child and the woman. Also, the exercise of power of the State will be studied in order to find a 
measure preventing the aforementioned examination from unduly affecting a personhs right.  

It is found from the study that age and sex of the person to be examined are not taken 
into consideration when Section 131/1 of the Criminal Procedure Code is prescribed. This leads 
the child and the woman to inadequate protection. In addition, at the stage of an inquiry, the 
responsible inquiry official is empowered to order the examination of persons to be conducted. 
Such exercise of power is not checked by the external agency therefore the exercise of power of 
the State excessively affects the right of a person who is examined. This differs from the 
provision of foreign laws which is prescribed with due regard to age and sex of the person to be 
examined. It provides that if the examined person is a child, before collecting the sample of such 
personhs body to examine by scientific method, the consent of his or her parents or his or her 
guardian is also required. The examined person who is a woman is also protected: if, in 
examining her body, the woman must be undressed and is embarrassed, it is provided that the 
examination must be conducted by the woman. Moreover, there is a guideline protecting the 
examined person who is either a child or woman. The guideline provides that the parents or 
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guardian of the examined child or woman or other person to whom such person confides is 
allowed to be present during his or her examination. In Germany, it is prescribed that the 
examination of persons must be permitted by the court. This is an external check that prevents 
undue impact on a personhs right resulting from the exercise of power of the State. 

With all above mentioned, the author finds that the Criminal Procedure Code should 
be revised and amended. At the stage of an inquiry, the court should be the one being entitled to 
order the examination of persons to be conducted so that the exercise of power of the State does 
not unduly affects the right of the examined person. In addition, the rule that protects the child 
and the woman should be established. It should provide that, other than the consent of the child, 
the examination must be done with the consent of the parents or the guardian of the child. And, in 
the case that the examined person is a woman, it should provide that the examination must be 
done by the female official so that the examined woman will not feel embarrassed. Other than 
that, it should provide that the examined child and woman have the right to allow his or her 
parents, his or her guardian or other persons to whom he or she confides to be present while he or 
she is examined. With all earlier mentioned, the child and woman will be sufficiently protected, 
like what foreign law does. 


